
Johns Creek 1 Dam (McDaniel’s Lake) 

Public Meeting  

Date:  Tuesday, October 17, 2017 

Place: Craig County Courthouse New Castle, Virginia 

Time: 7:00 PM 

Sponsors: Craig County Board of Supervisors and Mountain Castles 

Soil & Water Conservation District 

The Craig County Board of Supervi-
sors and the Mountain Castles Soil 
and Water Conservation District are 
working in cooperation with the 
USDA Natural Resources Conserva-
tion Service (NRCS) to develop a 
plan for the rehabilitation of the 
Johns Creek Watershed flood con-
trol dam #1 (McDaniel’s Lake).  The 
study is to determine the best alter-
natives for rehabilitation so the dam 
will meet current state dam safety 
regulations and design standards. 
Alternatives being considered in-
clude:   

• No Action 

• Decommissioning (Dam removal) 

• Structural Rehabilitation 

• Nonstructural Measures 

The purpose of this meeting is to de-
scribe the study process and seek 
public input relative to the manage-
ment of this structure for the plan-
ning horizon.  NRCS, State, County 
and District staff will be present to 
discuss your questions and con-
cerns.  Please plan to attend. 

For further information call Marlon Old, Conservation Technician, Mountain Castles Soil and Water    

Conservation District, at 540.400.0707 


